
If you do not receive a phone or email confirmation within 15 minutes,
please call C3 at 866.677.3493 to confirm receipt of your order.

Please call for delivery time availability on same day orders.

FAX COVER
FAX TO: 713.758.0125

To: Corporate Catering Concierge Date:

Fax: 713.758.0125 Pages: with cover

Company Name:

Delivery Address: Floor/ Suite:

Contact Name:

Email Address:

Phone Number: Ext.:

Cell Number:

Number of people you will be serving:

Payment By: Check AMEX Visa MCard

Time Requested:

Date Requested:

Card Number: Exp. Date:

CVV: Billing Zip Code:

Comments:



Palios Pizza Cafe - Group Hot Entrees

JUST FOR YOU

Ordering $150 or More? Get a free lunch!

Place an order of $150.00 or more (total food cost no including
tax or delivery charges) and receive a complimentary lunch
(value cannot exceed $15). Your lunch will be packaged
separately, with y

$0

PLATES AND UTENSILS

Plates, napkins, utensils, cups, lids and straws

Please include the number of guests you will be serving. We
will provide the appropriate number of service items for your
meal.

$0.25

SALADS

Caesar Salad $4.49

Dinner Salad $4.99

Greek Salad

Feta cheese, sun-dried tomatoes and kalamata olives.

$5.99

Hawaiian Salad

Cashews, pineapple, sun-dried tomatoes and cranberries.

$6.49

Cali Spinach Salad

Spinach, cranberries, almonds, pineapple, red onion, cheddar
cheese and walnut raspberry dressing.

$6.49

Chef Salad

Mixed greens lettuce, tomato, cucumber, olives, mixed
peppers, cheddar, sliced ham and pepperoni and your choice of
dressing.

$6.99



SMALL PIZZAS

The Classic

Roasted chicken, fresh tomatoes, fresh basil, fresh garlic, virgin
olive oil and mozzarella.

$10.99

Mollys

Roasted chicken, baby spinach, fresh roma tomatoes, oregano,
sesame seeds, virgin olive oil, mozzarella and feta cheese.

$10.99

Cade N Blake $10.99

Graces

Alfredo sauce, roasted chicken, fresh spinach, fresh
mushrooms, mozzarella and cheddar.

$10.99

Palios Vegetable

Black olives, onions, fresh mushrooms, red, yellow and green
peppers, tomatoes, spinach and mozzarella.

$10.99

Ralphies

Alfredo sauce, ham, chicken, bacon, cheddar and mozzarella,
topped with ranch.

$10.99

Franks Buffalo Chicken

Buffalo sauce, chicken, bacon, mozzarella and cheddar,
drizzled with ranch dressing.

$10.99

The Jimmy

Spicy all-natural red sauce, italian salami, pepperoni, bacon,
fresh jalapenos, roasted corn and mozzarella cheese.

$10.99

The Prestino

Garlic butter, olive oil, fresh garlic, salami, meatballs,
mushrooms, feta, basil and mozzarella cheese.

$10.99



The King

Pepperoni, sausage, ham, fresh mushrooms, black olives,
onions, red, yellow and green peppers and mozzarella.

$10.99

Meat and Cheese Deluxe

Pepperoni, sausage, beef, ham, bacon, cheddar and
mozzarella.

$10.99

Noahs

Pink sauce, caramelized onions, roasted chicken, bacon,
cheddar and mozzarella.

$10.99

The Mediterranean

Baby spinach, roma tomatoes, red onions, fresh mushrooms,
artichoke hearts, feta and mozzarella.

$10.99

Hawaiian Sunrise

Ham, pineapple, roasted cashews, sun dried cranberries with
mozzarella and cheddar cheese.

$10.99

Quattro Formagio

Feta, cheddar, mozzarella and parmesan cheese.

$10.99

Sereen

Alfredo sauce, baby spinach, roma tomatoes, fresh garlic, feta,
mozzarella cheese and olive oil on a whole wheat crust.

$10.99

Scorcher

Spicy red sauce, chicken, red onions, roasted corn, jalapenos,
garlic and mozzarella, topped with cilantro and squeeze of lime.

$10.99

Marias BBQ Chicken

Roasted chicken, red onions, cheddar, mozzarella cheese and
bacon.

$10.99

Build Your Own



Includes red sauce and mozzarella cheese. $7.99

Nutty Chicken

**Contains cashews** Roasted cashews, roasted chicken, fresh
mushrooms, spinach, grated parmesan and mozzarella.

$10.99

CALZONES AND STROMBOLI

Calzones (Small)

Choose Your Calzone

$9.99

Build You Own Calzone (Small)

Choose Your Fillings (Includes Red Sauce, Mozzarella and
Ricotta Cheese)

$6.99

Stromboli (Small)

Choose Your Stromboli

$9.99

Build Your Own Stromboli (Small)

Choose Your Fillings (Includes Red Sauce, Mozzarella and
Ricotta Cheese)

$6.99

PASTA BOX LUNCHES

Chicken Parmesan Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Chicken Il Palio Box Lunch

Chicken, mushrooms, artichokes, fettuccine and alfredo sauce.
Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Chicken Alfredo Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Blackened Chicken Alfredo Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99



Shrimp Alfredo Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$10.49

Baked Ziti with Marinara Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Baked Ziti with Meat Sauce Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Baked Mac & Cheese Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$8.99

Shrimp Il Palio Box Lunch

Shrimp, mushrooms, artichokes, fettuccine and alfredo. Served
with garlic bread.

$10.99

Manicotti Box Lunch

Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Ravioli Box Lunch

Stuffed with seasoned beef and cheese. Served with garlic
bread.

$9.99

Palios Florentine Box Lunch

Chicken, bacon, mushrooms, artichokes, spinach, fettucine and
alfredo sauce. Served with garlic bread.

$10.49

Pasta Primavera Box Lunch

Spinach, sauteed mushrooms, peppers, chicken and tomatoes.
Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

Cheese Tortellini Box Lunch

Rred and white sauce. Served with garlic bread.

$9.99

DESSERTS



Chocolate Mousse Cake $4.99

New York Cheesecake $4.99

Caramel Turtle Cheesecake $4.99

Tiramisu $4.99

Cannoli

Chocolate or Vanilla Shell

$3.49

BEVERAGES

Iced Tea (Gallon)

** Does not include ice or cups** Includes lemons and
sweeteners.

$10

Coke (2 liter)

** Does not include ice or cups**

$3.99

Diet Coke (2 liter)

** Does not include ice or cups**

$3.99

Sprite (2 liter)

** Does not include ice or cups**

$3.99

Dr. Pepper (2 liter)

** Does not include ice or cups**

$3.99

Root Beer (2 liter)

** Does not include ice or cups**

$3.99

Coke (12 oz. can) $1.99

Diet Coke (12 oz. can) $1.99



Sprite (12 oz. can) $1.99

Dr. Pepper (12 oz. can) $1.99

Root Beer (12 oz. can) $1.99

Ice (2 lbs) $3


