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Red River Cantina

SERVICE LEVELS

**SPECIAL DIETARY ITEM**

Any food allergies or dietary restrictions should be noted here
to ensure your meal is handled with care. The chef will prepare
a meal accordingly or you can describe in detail what you would
like

$20

JUST FOR YOU

Ordering $150 or More? Get a free lunch!

Place an order of $150.00 or more (total food cost no including
tax or delivery charges) and receive a complimentary lunch
(value cannot exceed $15). Your lunch will be packaged
separately, with y

$0

PLATES AND UTENSILS

Complimentary Disposable Set Ups

(Per person) Please include the number of guests you will be
serving. We will provide the appropriate number of service
items for your meal.

$0

APPETIZERS

Chips and Dip Pack 1

(Serves 3-4) A pint of salsa and a pint of chile con queso
served with 1 pound of chips.

$21.95

Chips and Dip Pack 2

(Serves 6-8) A quart of salsa and a quart of chile con queso
served with 2 pound of chips.

$36.95

Chicken Flauta Tray (24)



Crispy chicken flautas, served with a pint of chile con queso for
dipping.

$64.95

Shrimp Brochette (Dozen) $39.95

Baby Back Ribs (Half Rack) $15.95

SALAD PANS

Fajita Ensalada Pack 1

(Serves 10-12) Your choice of lettuce with red onion, purple
cabbage, diced avocado, radish, jicama, cherry tomatoes,
tortilla strips, queso fresco, and chicken fajita meat, with chips
and salsa, a

$144.95

Fajita Ensalada Pack 2

(Serves 20-24) Your choice of lettuce with red onion, purple
cabbage, diced avocado, radish, jicama, cherry tomatoes,
tortilla strips, queso fresco, and chicken fajita meat, with chips
and salsa, a

$288.95

Ensalada de Casa 1

(Serves 10-12) Fresh greens topped with red onion, shredded
carrots, cherry tomatoes, crispy tortilla strips and queso fresco.

$24.95

Ensalada de Casa 2

(Serves 20-24) Fresh greens topped with red onion, shredded
carrots, cherry tomatoes, crispy tortilla strips and queso fresco.

$49.95

FAJITAS

Fajita Pack 1

(Serves 3) 1 pound of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and chips

$62.95



Fajita Pack 2

(Serves 4-6) 2 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and chi

$125.95

Fajita Pack 3

(Serves 7-9) 3 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and chi

$188.95

Fajita Pack 4

(Serves 10-12) 4 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and c

$221.95

Fajita Pack 5

(Serves 13-15) 5 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and c

$277.95

Fajita Pack 6

(Serves 16-18) 6 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and c

$332.95

Fajita Pack 7

(Serves 19-21) 7 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and c

$387.95

Fajita Pack 8



(Serves 22-25) 8 pounds of tender beef and chicken fajitas with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and c

$461.95

Vegetarian Fajitas (Entree)

(Per person) Zucchini, squash, onion, bell pepper with Mexican
rice, vegetarian refried black beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
sour cream, grated cheese, grilled onions, fresh flour tortillas,
and

$16.95

Beef Fajita (A La Carte)

1 pound of beef fajita meat with grilled onions.

$49.95

Chicken Fajita (A La Carte)

1 pound of chicken fajita meat with grilled onions.

$29.95

ENCHILADAS & LASAGNA

Enchilada Pack 1

(Serves 2-3) Your choice of 6 enchiladas with Mexican rice,
refried beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates,
Flatware and Serving Utensils are included upon request**

$42.95

Enchilada Pack 2

(Serves 4-6) Your choice of 12 enchiladas with Mexican rice,
refried beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates,
Flatware and Serving Utensils are included upon request**

$72.95

Enchilada Pack 3

(Serves 7-9) Your choice of 18 enchiladas with Mexican rice,
refried beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates,
Flatware and Serving Utensils are included upon request**

$109.95

Enchilada Pack 4

(Serves 10-12) Your choice of 24 enchiladas with Mexican rice,
refried beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates,



Flatware and Serving Utensils are included upon request** $144.95

Enchiladas (Dozen)

Your choice of enchilada per dozen.

$29.95

Mexican Lasagna (Pan)

(Serves 8 to 10) Your choice of: Beef picadillo with chili con
carne or Ranchero chicken with sour cream sauce.

$49.95

TACOS

Taco Pack 1

(Serves 2-3) Your choice of 6 tacos and tortillas with shredded
lettuce, diced tomatoes, grated cheese, Mexican rice, refried
beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates, Flatware and
Serving U

$42.95

Taco Pack 2

(Serves 4-6) Your choice of 12 tacos and tortillas with shredded
lettuce, diced tomatoes, grated cheese, Mexican rice, refried
beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates, Flatware and
Serving

$72.95

Taco Pack 3

(Serves 7-9) Your choice of 18 tacos and tortillas with shredded
lettuce, diced tomatoes, grated cheese, Mexican rice, refried
beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates, Flatware and
Serving

$109.95

Taco Pack 4

(Serves 10-12) Your choice of 24 tacos and tortillas with
shredded lettuce, diced tomatoes, grated cheese, Mexican rice,
refried beans, chips and red salsa. **Disposable Plates,
Flatware and Servin

$144.95

TAMALES

Pork Tamales (Dozen) $21.95



SALAD ENTREES

Ensalada De Casa (Entree)

Fresh greens topped with red onion, shredded carrots, cherry
tomatoes, crispy tortillas strips and queso fresco.

$7.25

Fajita Ensalada (Entree)

Your choice of lettuce and protein topped with red onion,
jicama, olives, cherry tomatoes, crispy bacon, boiled eggs,
diced avocado, crispy tortilla strips and queso fresco with your
choice of dres

$17.95

Taco Salad (Entree)

Fresh fried taco shell loaded with shredded lettuce, your choice
of protein, grated cheese, black beans, diced tomato, and sour
cream with guacamole, pico de gallo and your choice of
dressing.

$16.95

FAJITA BOX LUNCHES

Chicken Fajitas Box Lunch

Fresh chicken breast grilled over mesquite, served with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
fresh flour tortillas, chips, and salsa.

$19.95

Beef Fajitas Box Lunch

Tender outside skirt steak grilled over mesquite, served with
Mexican rice, your choice of beans, guacamole, pico de gallo,
fresh flour tortillas, chips, and salsa.

$34.95

Combo Fajitas Box Lunch

Tender outside skirt steak and fresh chicken breast grilled over
mesquite, served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans,
guacamole, pico de gallo, fresh flour tortillas, chips, and salsa.

$29.95

Shrimp Fajitas Box Lunch



Fresh gulf shrimp with grilled onions, bell peppers, zucchini and
squash, served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans,
guacamole, pico de gallo, fresh flour tortillas, chips, and salsa.

$23.95

ENCHILADA BOX LUNCHES

Cheese Enchilada Box Lunch

Two cheese enchildas served with Mexican rice, your choice of
beans, chips and salsa.

$14.95

Enchiladas De Pollo Box Lunch

Two ranchero chicken enchiladas topped with your choice of
sauce, served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans, chips
and salsa.

$16.95

Enchiladas De Carne Box Lunch

Two beef picadillo enchiladas topped with chili con carne and
grated cheese, served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans,
chips and salsa.

$16.95

Enchiladas Al Carbon Box Lunch

Two chicken fajita enchiladas topped with chile con carne and
grated cheese, served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans,
chips and salsa.

$18.95

Brisket Enchiladas Box Lunch

Two brisket enchiladas topped with sour cream sauce, grated
cheese and avocado, served with Mexican rice, your choice of
beans, chips and salsa.

$19.95

Enchiladas Camarones Box Lunch

Two enchiladas loaded with our shrimp stuffing and topped with
marisco sauce and avocado, served with Mexican rice, your
choice of beans, chips and salsa.

$22.95

Enchiladas Marisco Box Lunch



Two cheese enchiladas topped with sauteed shrimp and
scallops in a white wine cream sauce, served with Mexican rice,
your choice of beans, chips and salsa.

$24.95

Crawfish Enchiladas Box Lunch

Two enchiladas loaded with Louisiana crawfish and topped with
our white wine cream sauce and avocado, served with Mexican
rice, your choice of beans, chips and salsa.

$22.95

TACO AND BURRITO BOX LUNCHES

Taco Dinner Box Lunch

Your choice of two tacos loaded with shredded lettuce, diced
tomatoes and grated cheese, served with Mexican rice, your
choice of beans, chips and salsa.

$16.95

Tacos Al Carbon Box Lunch

Two chicken fajita tacos with pico de gallo and guacamole,
served with Mexican rice, your choice of beans, chips and
salsa.

$19.95

Tacos Del Mar Box Lunch

Your choice of two shrimp or Mahi-Mahi tacos on homemade
corn or flour tortillas. Loaded with escabeche, our siracha
avocado cream sauce and queso fresco, served with cilantro
rice, black beans, ch

$20.95

Burrito Monterey Box Lunch

Chicken fajita rolled in a flour tortilla with refried black beans
and chile con queso and topped with our sour cream sauce,
Monterey jack cheesee and pico de gallo, served with Mexican
rice, your

$18.95

Burrito Classic Box Lunch

Beef picadillo rolled in a flour tortilla with refried beans and chile
con queso, topped with our chile con carne and grated cheese
with pico de gallo on the side, served with Mexican rice, your ch

$17.95



SIDES

Chips (Pound) $3.95

Fresh Flour Tortillas (Dozen)

ONE DOZEN

$4.95

Fresh Corn Tortillas (Dozen)

ONE DOZEN

$4.95

Chile Con Queso (Pint)

(Serves 8)

$14.95

Chile Con Queso (Quart)

(Serves 16)

$25.95

Guacamole (Pint)

(Serves 8)

$14.5

Guacamole (Quart)

(Serves 16)

$28.95

Pico De Gallo (Pint)

(Serves 8)

$6.95

Pico De Gallo (Quart)

(Serves 16)

$12.95

Red Salsa (Pint)

(Serves 8) Served with chips.

$6.95

Red Salsa (Quart)

(Serves 16) Served with chips.

$12.95

Green Sauce (Pint)

(Serves 8) Served with chips.

$8.95



Green Sauce (Quart)

(Serves 16) Served with chips.

$15.95

Grated Cheddar Cheese (Pint)

(Serves 8)

$6.95

Grated Cheddar Cheese (Quart)

(Serves 16)

$12.95

Sour Cream (Pint)

(Serves 8)

$6.95

Sour Cream (Quart)

(Serves 16)

$12.95

Rice (Pint)

(Serves 4)

$6.95

Rice (Quart)

(Serves 8)

$9.95

Beans (Pint)

(Serves 4)

$6.95

Beans (Quart)

(Serves 8)

$9.95

DESSERTS

Tres Leches (Whole)

(Serves 12-16) Served with fresh strawberries.

$44.95

Tres Leches

(Per person) Served with fresh strawberries.

$9.25



La Muerte del Chocolate (Whole)

(Serves 12-16) Homemade brownie loaded with dark chocolate,
Godiva white chocolate chunks, pecans and topped with
chocolate syrup.

$36.95

La Muerte del Chocolate

(Per person) Homemade brownie loaded with dark chocolate,
Godiva white chocolate chunks, pecans and topped with
chocolate syrup.

$9.25

Sopapillas

(6 pieces) Served with powdered sugar, cinnamon and honey.

$8.25

BEVERAGES

Iced Tea (Gallon)

(Serves 10-12) Includes cups, ice, sweetener and lemon
wedges.

$10.95

Sweet Iced Tea (Gallon)

(Serves 10-12) Includes cups, ice and lemon wedges.

$10.95

Lemonade (Gallon)

(Serves 1012) Includes cups and ice.

$10.95

Bottled Water $1.5

Coke (12 oz. can) $1.75

Diet Coke (12 oz. can) $1.75

Dr. Pepper (12 oz. can) $1.75

Sprite (12 oz. can) $1.75



Margaritas (Half Gallon) $26.95

Margaritas (Gallon) $49.95


