
If you do not receive a phone or email confirmation within 15 minutes,
please call C3 at 866.677.3493 to confirm receipt of your order.

Please call for delivery time availability on same day orders.

FAX COVER
FAX TO: 713.758.0125

To: Corporate Catering Concierge Date:

Fax: 713.758.0125 Pages: with cover
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Delivery Address: Floor/ Suite:

Contact Name:

Email Address:

Phone Number: Ext.:

Cell Number:

Number of people you will be serving:

Payment By: Check AMEX Visa MCard

Time Requested:

Date Requested:

Card Number: Exp. Date:

CVV: Billing Zip Code:

Comments:



Schlotzskys

SERVICE LEVELS

**SPECIAL DIETARY ITEM**

Any food allergies or dietary restrictions should be noted here
to ensure your meal is handled with care. The chef will prepare
a meal accordingly or you can describe in detail what you would
like

$10

JUST FOR YOU

Ordering $150 or More? Get a free lunch!

Place an order of $150.00 or more (total food cost no including
tax or delivery charges) and receive a complimentary lunch
(value cannot exceed $15). Your lunch will be packaged
separately, with y

$0

PLATES AND UTENSILS

Complimentary Plates, Napkins, Utensils & Serving
Utensils $0.00
Please include the number of guests you will be serving. We
will provide the appropriate number of service items for your
meal.

$0

SALAD BOX LUNCHES

Caesar Salad w/ Chicken Box Lunch

Fresh mix of romaine lettuce with hand-carved chicken breast,
Parmesan cheese and croutons with Caesar dressing or
dressing of your choice. Served with house-made garlic
breadsticks and dessert.

$11.99

Cobb Salad w/ Turkey Box Lunch



Fresh mixed field greens and romaine blended with hand-
carved turkey breast, chopped bacon, goat cheese, avocado,
diced egg, tomato, corn and black bean mix and croutons with
blue cheese dressing o

$11.99

Orchard Salad w/ Chicken Box Lunch

Fresh mixed field greens and romaine blended with hand-
carved chicken breast, goat cheese, candied pecans, dried
cranberries, apple wedges, red onion and croutons with fat free
raspberry vinaigrett

$11.99

Garden Salad Box Lunch

Fresh mixed greens and romaine blend, black olives, diced
tomatoes and cucumber slices with ranch dressing or dressing
of your choice. Served with house-made garlic breadsticks and
dessert.

$10.99

OVEN BAKED SANDWICH BOX LUNCHES

Original Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch (Medium)

Lean smoked ham with Genoa and Cotto salamis, cheddar,
mozzarella and Parmesan cheeses, black olives, lettuce, red
onion, tomato, mustard and our signature sauce on our toasted
house-made sourdough

$11.99

Fiesta Chicken Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch (Medium)
Roasted chicken breast with cheddar cheese, black olives,
roasted red peppers, lettuce, red and green onions, tomato and
chipotle mayonnaise on our toasted house-made jalapeno
cheese bun. Served wi

$11.99

Turkey Original Style Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch
(Medium)
Smoked turkey breast with Genoa salami, cheddar, mozzarella
and Parmesan cheeses, black olives, lettuce, onion, tomato, lite
mayo, and our signature sauce on our toasted house-made



sourdough bun. S $11.99

Turkey Bacon Club Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch
(Medium)
Smoked turkey breast with bacon strips, cheddar, mozzarella
and Parmesan cheeses, lettuce, tomato, lite mayo and our
signature sauce on our toasted house-made sourdough bun.
Served with chips or sa

$11.99

Smoked Turkey Breast Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch
(Medium)
Smoked turkey breast with lettuce, tomato and lite mayo on our
toasted house-made sourdough bun. Served with chips or
salad, a pickle spear and dessert.

$11.99

Roast Beef & Cheese Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch
(Medium)
Roast beef with cheddar, mozarella and Parmesan cheeses,
lettuce, tomato, mustard, lite mayo and our signature sauce on
our toasted house-made sourdough bun. Served with chips or
salad, a pickle sp

$11.99

Ham & Cheese Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch (Medium)
Lean smoked ham with cheddar, mozzarella and Parmesan
cheeses, lettuce, tomato, mustard, and our signature sauce on
our toasted house-made sourdough bun. Served with chips or
salad, a pickle spear

$11.99

Fresh Veggie Oven Baked Sandwich Box Lunch (Medium)
Cheddar cheese with cucumber slices, black olives, lettuce,
onion, tomato and ranch dressing on our toasted house-made
sourdough bun. Served with chips or salad, a pickle spear and
dessert.

$11.99



WRAP BOX LUNCHES

Caesar Salad w/ Chicken Wrap Box Lunch

Grillled chicken, romaine lettuce, cheese and croutons with
Caesar dressing or dressing of your choice. Served with chips
or salad, a pickle spear, and dessert.

$11.99

Greek Salad Wrap w/ Chicken Box Lunch

Fresh mix of romaine lettuce with hand-carved chicken breast,
feta cheese, onions, olives, banana peppers, and tomatoes with
Greek dressing or dressing of your choice.

$11.99

Strawberry Salad Wrap w/ Chicken Box Lunch

Fresh mix of romaine lettuce with hand-carved chicken breast,
feta cheese, strawberries, candied pecans, and croutons with
balsamic vinaigrette dressing.

$11.99

Cobb Salad w/ Turkey Wrap Box Lunch

Turkey breast, mixed field greens and romaine, bacon, blue
cheese, avocado, egg, tomato and croutons. Served with chips
or salad, a pickle spear, and dessert.

$11.99

Orchard Salad w/ Chicken Wrap Box Lunch

Mixed field greens and romaine blended with hand-carved
chicken breast, goat cheese, candied pecans, dried
cranberries, apple wedges, red onion and croutons. Served
with chips or salad, a pickle sp

$11.99

Garden Salad Wrap Box Lunch

Mixed field greens and romaine, black olives, tomatoes,
cucumber and croutons. Customize to add a protein choice.
Served with chips or salad, a pickle spear, and dessert.

$10.99

PIZZA BOX LUNCHES

California Chicken & Avocado Pizza Box Lunch



Hand-carved chicken breast with chopped bacon, mozzarella
and cheddar cheeses, avocado, roasted red pepper and
chipotle aioli on your choice of an artisan flatbread or a house-
made sourdough pizza

$11.99

BBQ Chicken & Jalapeno Pizza Box Lunch

Hand-carved chicken breast with mozzarella and cheddar
cheeses, BBQ sauce, onion and pickled jalapenos on your
choice of an artisan flatbread or a house-made sourdough
pizza crust. Served with chip

$11.99

Pepperoni & Double Cheese Pizza Box Lunch

Two cheeses, pepperoni and marinara on your choice of an
artisan flatbread or a house-made sourdough pizza crust.
Served with chips or salad, Parmesan, red pepper flakes,
dessert and a mint.

$11.99

Double Cheese Pizza Box Lunch

Mozzarella and Parmesan cheeses with marinara on your
choice of an artisan flatbread or a house-made sourdough
pizza crust. Served with chips or salad, Parmesan, red pepper
flakes, dessert and a mi

$11.99

Veggie Supreme Pizza Box Lunch

Two cheeses, mushrooms, green peppers, onions, black olives,
tomatoes and marinara on your choice of an artisan flatbread or
a house-made sourdough pizza crust. Served with chips or
salad, Parmesan

$11.99

SALAD PANS

Caesar Salad

(Serves 10) Served with breadsticks, choice of two dressings
and mints.

$36.99

Cobb Salad



(Serves 10) Served with breadsticks, choice of two dressings
and mints.

$36.99

Orchard Salad

(Serves 10) Served with breadsticks, choice of two dressings
and mints.

$36.99

Garden Salad

(Serves 10) Served with breadsticks, choice of two dressings
and mints.

$36.99

SANDWICH AND WRAP TRAYS

Small Oven Baked Sandwich Tray

(Serves 5-7) Choose 5 sandwiches from the Oven-Baked
Sandwich list (maximum 3 choices)

$45.99

Large Oven Baked Sandwich Tray

(Serves 10-14) Choose 10 sandwiches from the Oven-Baked
Sandwich list (maximum 3 choices)

$85.99

Small Salad Wrap Tray

(Serves 5-7) Choose 5 salads from the list (maximum 3
choices) and we'll turn them into wraps. Served with pickle
spears and your choice of 2 dressings.

$40.99

Large Salad Wrap Tray

(Serves 10-14) Choose 10 salads from the list (maximum 3
choices) and we'll turn them into wraps. Served with pickle
spears and your choice of 2 dressings.

$79.99

SOUPS

Broccoli Cheese Soup (Half Gallon)

(Serves 8) Creamy blend of cheddar cheese and broccoli
florets, topped with cheddar cheese.

$26.99



Broccoli Cheese Soup (Cup)

Creamy blend of cheddar cheese and broccoli florets, topped
with cheddar cheese.

$5.99

Potato w/ Bacon Soup (Half Gallon)

(Serves 8) Hearty cream soup with potatoes and bacon bits,
topped with cheddar cheese, bacon bits and green onions.

$26.99

Potato w/ Bacon Soup (Cup)

Hearty cream soup with potatoes and bacon bits, topped with
cheddar cheese, bacon bits and green onions.

$5.99

Tomato Basil Soup (Half Gallon)

(Serves 8) Fresh, ripe tomatoes, basil and onions blended into
a smooth, creamy soup, topped with basil and parmesan
cheese.

$26.99

Tomato Basil Soup (Cup)

Fresh, ripe tomatoes, basil and onions blended into a smooth,
creamy soup, topped with basil and parmesan cheese.

$5.99

SIDES

Chips $1.59

DESSERTS

Cookie & Brownie Tray (Dozen)

Chocolate chip cookies and brownies.

$18.19

Cookie Tray (Dozen)

Chocolate chip cookies.

$18.19

Brownie Tray (Dozen) $18.19

Cinnabon Classic Roll



Baked fresh and served warm. $4.99

Cinnabon Classic Roll Pan

12 rolls baked fresh and served warm.

$40.99

Cinnabon Minibon Pan

15 mini rolls.

$26.99

Cinnabon Classic Roll Pan (half-dozen)

6 classic rolls.

$20.99

BEVERAGES

Unsweet Tea (Gallon)

(Serves 10) Includes cups, lemons, and sweetener. **Ice not
included**

$6.39

Sweet Tea (Gallon)

(Serves 10) Includes cups, lemons, and sweetener. **Ice not
included**

$6.39

Lemonade (Gallon)

(Serves 10) Includes cups, lemons, and sweetener. **Ice not
included**

$6.39

Bottled Water $2.09

Barqs Root Beer (Bottled) $2.49


