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Tout Suite - Breakfast

SERVICE LEVELS

Set Up Service

Our staff will set-up with real chafing dishes, all serving pieces
and have everything ready to enjoy at your required start time.
Then our staff person will return the same day to pick
everything

$75

**SPECIAL DIETARY ITEM**

Any food allergies or dietary restrictions should be noted here
to ensure your meal is handled with care. The chef will prepare
a meal accordingly or you can describe in detail what you would
like

$10

PLATES AND UTENSILS

Plates, Napkins, & Utensils

Please include the number of guests you will be serving. We
will provide the appropriate number of service items for your
meal.

$0.5

FROM THE BAKERY

Strawberry and Creme Croissant (Each) $5.25

Almond Croissant (Each) $4.5

Plain Croissant (Each) $4

Chocolate Croissant (Each) $4.5

Sausage and Cheese Croissant (Each) $5

Sausage, Peppers and Cheese Croissant (Each) $5.25



ACAI BOWLS & SMOOTHIES

The Classic Bowl

Antioxidant-loaded super fruit bowl with blended acai,
strawberries, blueberries, bananas topped with house-made
granola.

$15

Protein Bowl

Antioxidant-loaded super fruit bowl with blended acai,
strawberries, blueberries, bananas, hemp protein, pumpkin
seeds, and peanut butter topped with house-made granola.

$17.5

Green Bowl

Antioxidant-loaded super fruit bowl with blended acai,
strawberries, blueberries, bananas, kale, spinach and spirulina
topped with house-made granola.

$16.5

Half & Half Bowl

Antioxidant-loaded super fruit bowl with half blended acai and
half yogurt with blackberries, goji berries topped with house-
made granola.

$14.25

The Classic Smoothie

Acai with bananas, strawberries and blueberries.

$12.5

Green Smoothie

The classic with kale, spinach and spirulina.

$14

Protein Smoothie

The classic with hemp protein.

$14

QUICHE

Ham & Cheese with Caramelized Onions Quiche

(Serves 8)

$60

Heirloom Tomatoes, Spinach & Feta Quiche



(Serves 8) $60

TOAST SERIES

Avocado Toast

Avocado topped with radishes, red pepper flakes and chives on
ciabatta.

$14.85

Smoked Sustainable Salmon Toast

Nordic Blu house-cured applewood salmon over garlic herb
cream cheese and topped with fried cappers and dill on
ciabatta.

$18

Toast Sampler

One slice of avocado toast and one slice of smoked sustainable
salmon.

$17.5

BREAKFAST TACOS

Breakfast Tacos (Small)

(15 Tacos) Served with your choice of green or red salsa.

$72

Breakfast Tacos (Medium)

(25 Tacos) Served with your choice of green or red salsa.

$120

Breakfast Tacos (Large)

(35 Tacos) Served with your choice of green or red salsa.

$105

Breakfast Taco (1)

Served with your choice of green or red salsa.

$4.8

Breakfast Taco (2)

Served with your choice of green or red salsa.

$9.75

Breakfast Burrito

Gluten-Free Wrap with scrambled eggs, tomatoes, cheese and
choice of protein.

$12.5



HOT BREAKFAST

Breakfast Hash

Scrambled or sunny egg topped with diced potatoes, onions,
bell peppers and with choice of protein.

$11

The Classic

Two eggs scrambled or sunny served with tomatoes,
sourdough bread and your choice of protein.

$12

Breakfast Croissant

Scrambled eggs, tomatoes, cheese and choice of protein on
croissant.

$12.5

Breakfast Stuffed Avocado

Avocado half with sunny egg and chopped bacon

$9

PLATTERS AND TRAYS

Fruit Platter

(Per person) Assorted seasonal fruit.

$5.5

Pastry Tray (Small)

(Serves 10-12) An assortment of our freshly baked muffins,
croissants, cookies, brownies and loaves.

$54

Pastry Tray (Medium)

(Serves 12-15) An assortment of our freshly baked muffins,
croissants, cookies, brownies and loaves.

$68

Pastry Tray (Large)

(Serves 15-20) An assortment of our freshly baked muffins,
croissants, cookies, brownies and loaves.

$130

Savory Croissant Platter (Small)



(10 pieces) An assortment of Sausage & Cheese and Sausage,
Peppers & Cheese croissants.

$53

Savory Croissant Platter (Medium)

(15 pieces) An assortment of Sausage & Cheese and Sausage,
Peppers & Cheese croissants.

$80

Savory Croissant Platter (Large)

(20 pieces) An assortment of Sausage & Cheese and Sausage,
Peppers & Cheese croissants.

$160

SIDES

Side Breakfast Hash

Diced potatoes topped with onions and bell peppers.

$6.5

Side Breakfast Hash

Diced potatoes topped with onions and bell peppers.

$6.5

Fruit Cup $8.5

BEVERAGES

Orange Juice (80 oz.)

Served with cups and ice.

$35

House Coffee (80 oz.)

Served with cups, creamers and sweeteners.

$35

Iced Black Tea (80 oz.)

Served with cups, sweeteners and lemons.

$30

Iced Green Tea (80 oz.)

Served with cups, sweeteners and lemons.

$30

Ca Phe Sua Da



Vietnamese iced coffee. $5

Bottled Water $2.95

Mexican Coke $2.75

Iced Black Tea $3.5

Milk Tea $3.75

EXTRAS

Catering Service Agreement

TO CONFIRM AND FINALIZE YOUR EVENT: The catering
agreement must be signed and sent to your C3 rep.
GUARANTEED ATTENDANCE - Guaranteed Attendance is
due 5 business days prior to my event and may

$0


