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Voss Kitchen - Breakfast

SERVICE LEVELS

Set Up Service

Our staff will set-up with a buffet linen, chafing dishes, all
serving pieces and have everything ready to enjoy at your
required start time. Then the staff person will return the same
day to pick

$75

Full Service Set Up

Two attendants will deliver and set up your food using buffet
linen, nice platters, chaffing dishes and provide nice containers
for your beverages. Then one attendant will return after your
recepti

$150

Additional Set Up Service

This will be used for an additional set up service when
delivering to the same location at the same time. Our staff will
set-up with a white buffet linen, chafing dishes, all serving
pieces and hav

$35

*SPECIAL DIETARY ITEM*

Any food allergies or dietary restrictions should be noted here
to ensure your meal is handled with care. The chef will prepare
a meal accordingly or you can describe in detail what you would
like

$17.95

JUST FOR YOU

Ordering $150 or More? Get a free Box Breakfast!

Place an order of $150.00 or more (total food cost no including
tax or delivery charges) and receive a complimentary lunch
(value cannot exceed $15). Your lunch will be packaged
separately, with y

$0

PLATES AND UTENSILS



Complimentary Plates, Napkins, Utensils & Serving
Utensils
Please include the number of guests you will be serving. We
will provide the appropriate number of service items for your
meal.

$0

BREAKFAST BOXES

Deluxe Breakfast Box

Your choice of breakfast sandwich served with a muffin, yogurt
and fresh fruit cup.

$9.5

Breakfast Quiche Box

(5 MINIMUM) Your choice of homemade quiche served with
fruit salad.

$7.95

Country Breakfast Box

Scrambled eggs, fluffy biscuit with gravy, bacon or sausage,
breakfast potatoes, and a fresh fruit cup.

$11.95

Breakfast Taco Box

Two tacos of your choice served with salsa and fresh fruit cup
and a Mexican pastry.

$7.95

Breakfast Sandwich Box

Your choice of sandwich on a freshly baked bagel or croissant.
Served with a fresh fruit cup and yogurt.

$8.95

Challah French Toast Breakfast Box

Two pieces of French toast, served with maple syrup and
powdered sugar on the side, a fresh fruit cup and a choice of
bacon or breakfast potatoes

$9.95

Continental Breakfast Box

Two freshly baked pastries, a fresh fruit cup and yogurt.

$8.95



CONTINENTAL PACKAGES

American Breakfast

(10 minimum) Mixed breakfast with small croissants, small
muffins, assorted danishes, assorted breakfast breads, mini
frittatas, and fresh fruit.

$8.95

Continental Breakfast

(10 minimum / 2 pieces per person) Croissants, bagels,
muffins, assorted danishes and sliced fresh fruit. Includes
assorted jams and cream cheese.

$7.95

HEALTHY START

Healthy Breakfast Buffet

(10 minimum) Fresh fruit platter, scrambled egg whites, turkey
bacon, and whole wheat toast. Served with butter and jelly.
Choice of two ingredients to the egg white scramble: tomatoes,
onions, be

$10.95

Healthy Breakfast Buffet

(10 minimum) Fresh fruit platter, scrambled egg whites, turkey
bacon, and whole wheat toast. Served with butter and jelly.
Choice of two ingredients to the egg white scramble: tomatoes,
onions, be

$10.95

Egg Scramble (Full Pan)

(Serves 20-25) Egg with bell peppers, onions, cheese,
mushrooms and asparagus.

$65

Miniature Quiche

(10 minimum / 2 per person) Variety of quiche; Florentine, Ham
& Cheese, Vegetable, or Bacon & Cheese.

$4.25

Oatmeal

Served buffet style or individually with blueberries, raisins,
brown sugar and milk.

$6.35



Museli

Individually portioned traditional European cold breakfast cereal
made with natural rolled oats mixed with milk, apples, bananas,
cranberries, sliced almonds, and topped with a hint of honey.

$2.99

Seasonal Fresh Fruit Tray

(10 minimum) Pineapple, grapes, honeydew, cantaloupe and
watermelon.

$4.25

Fruit & Cheese Tray

(10 minimum) Fresh grapes and berries with cheddar, swiss,
pepper jack and monterey jack cheeses. Served with gourmet
crackers.

$4.95

Whole Pieces of Fruit (Each)

Choose from apples. oranges, and bananas.

$2.25

Yogurt Parfait Bar

Yogurt served with fresh strawberries, blueberries and granola
on the side.

$4.5

Greek Yogurt Parfait

Greek yogurt served with fresh strawberries, blueberries and
granola on the side.

$5.5

Yogurt Parfait

Vanilla yogurt served with fresh strawberries, blueberries and
granola on the side.

$4.5

Fruit Flavored Yogurt $2.45

Granola $2.99

Whole Wheat Toast with Peanut butter

2 pieces of whole wheat toast served with 2.5 oz. of peanut
butter.

$1



PASTRIES

New York Bagels (Dozen)

*24 HOURS NOTICED REQUIRED* Assorted New York bagels
with 16 oz. whipped cream cheese, butter, and jam. Choose
between regular whipped cream cheese, scallion cream
cheese, or for lox cream cheese.

$24.95

Cocktail Croissants (Dozen)

Served with butter and jam.

$16.95

New York Mini Bagels (Dozen)

*24 HOURS NOTICED REQUIRED* Assorted mini New York
bagels with 16 oz. whipped cream cheese, butter, and jam.
Choose between regular whipped cream cheese, scallion
cream cheese, or for lox cream ch

$20.95

Muffins (Dozen)

Choice of blueberry, chocolate, or banana nut. Served with
continental butter and jam.

$19.95

Mini Deluxe Muffins (Dozen)

(2 dozen minimum) Fresh baked mini muffins.

$21.5

Mini Muffins (Each)

(10 minimum)

$1

Gluten Free Muffins (Dozen)

**72 HOURS NOTICE REQUIRED** (2 dozen minimum)

$24

Large Croissants (Dozen)

Served with butter and jam.

$39.95

Scones (Dozen)

Your choice of blueberry, chocolate chunk, or brown sugar
cinnamon, Served with continental butter and jam.

$26.95



Assorted Breakfast Pastries

(10 minimum ). Assorted muffins, croissants and danishes.

$2.5

Assorted Mini Danishes (Dozen)

An assortment of cinnamon swirl, vanilla crown, raspberry
crown, maple pecan and apple conronet.

$19.95

Mini Breakfast Pastries

(10 minimum / 2 per person)

$3.95

Breakfast Breads (Loaf)

Choice of zucchini bread, banana bread, or carrot bread.

$14.25

Mini Cinnamon Rolls (Dozen) $19.95

Donuts (Dozen)

A variety of chocolate iced, golden glazed and sugar coated
raspberry filled.

$14.25

HOT BREAKFAST PACKAGES

Platinum Breakfast Buffet

Fresh fruit, breakfast potatoes, bacon, sausage patties,
pancakes with syrup on the side and scrambled eggs. Choice
of two ingredients for egg scramble: tomatoes, onions, bell
peppers, spinach, and

$13.25

Voss Deluxe Breakfast Buffet

Scrambled eggs, 2 pieces bacon, 2 pieces of sausage,
breakfast potatoes, a mini bagel, butter and jelly.

$9

Voss Breakfast Buffet

Scrambled eggs, bacon, breakfast potatoes, a mini bagel,
butter, and jelly.

$8.95

Voss Complete Breakfast



Choice of pancakes, French toast or waffles served with eggs,
choice of bacon or sausage, and fresh fruit. Served with butter,
syrup and powdered sugar on the side. Choice of two
ingredients fo

$10.95

Mexican Breakfast

(10 minimum) Two breakfast tacos, Mexican pastries and fresh
fruit.

$7.95

Country Breakfast

(10 minimum) Biscuits and gravy, scrambled eggs, bacon,
sausage links, hash browns, and a fresh fruit platter.

$10.95

Quiche (Whole)

(Serves 6-8) Choice of vegetable, ham and cheese, or bacon
and cheese.

$17.95

Mini Frittatas (3) $5.45

Egg White Scramble (Full Pan)

(Serves 20-25) Egg whites with bell peppers, onions,
mushrooms and asparagus.

$65

Traditional English Breakfast

Scrambled eggs, sausage, bacon, breakfast potatoes wedges,
grilled tomatoes, grilled mushrooms caps, toast and baked
beans. Served with assorted jellies and ketchup on the side.

$12.5

Steak & Eggs

(10 minimum) T-Bone steak served with scrambled eggs and
biscuit and gravy on the side.

$15.95

Chicken & Waffles

(10 MINIMUM) Two fried chicken tenders with a large Belgium
waffle and a fresh fruit platter. Served with syrup and butter.

$10.95

Pork Chop & Eggs



(10 minimum) Center cut pork chop served with scrambled
eggs and biscuit and gravy on the side.

$11.95

TACOS AND SANDWICHES

Breakfast Egg Muffins

(10 minimum) Baked potato crust, egg and cheese with choice
of meat or veggie.

$2.75

Breakfast Tacos (Each)

(10 minimum) Your choice of bacon egg & cheese, sausage
egg & cheese, or a vegan friendly taco (black beans, pico de
gallo, poblano pepper, and onions) All tacos are served with a
freshly made hot

$3.25

Bacon, Egg & Cheese Sandwich

(10 minimum) Served on choice of bread: croissant., biscuit, or
a bagel.

$6.55

Sausage, Egg & Cheese Sandwich

(10 minimum) Served on choice of bread: croissant., biscuit, or
a bagel.

$6.55

Ham, Egg & Cheese Sandwich

(10 minimum) Served on choice of bread: croissant., biscuit, or
a bagel.

$6.55

Veggie, Egg & Cheese Sandwich

(10 minimum) Sauteed spinach and mushroom served on
choice of bread: croissant, biscuit, or a bagel.

$5.45

Fried Chicken Biscuit Sandwich

(10 minimum)

$5.45

Egg & Cheese Sandwich

(10 minimum) Served on choice of bread: croissant., biscuit, or
a bagel.

$5.45



INTERNATIONAL PAIRINGS

Italian Pastries & Breads with Coffee

*48 HOURS NOTICE REQUIRED* (2 pieces per person)
Assortment of traditional Italian favorites such as Corneti,
Biscotti, sliced Brioche with butter and fresh jam, and seasonal
options when available

$9

BREAKFAST COOKED ON SITE

Omelet Station

(25 minimum) Includes eggs, egg whites, cheddar cheese,
mushrooms, onions, bell peppers, diced tomatoes, cilantro,
jalapenos, spinach, ham and bacon. Served with breakfast
potatoes and a fresh frui

$13.25

Waffle and Pancake Bar

(25 minimum) Includes fresh blueberries, fresh strawberries,
chocolate chips, nutella, whipped cream and syrup. Served with
breakfast potatoes and fresh fruit platter. **CHEF REQUIRED**
AN ADDITION

$11.95

Additional On Site Chef

$35.00 per hour after the initial four hours. Includes set- up,
cook, and area clean up.

$175

VEGAN PASTRIES

Vegan Muffin (Each) $4.5

Vegan Cinnamon Rolls (28) $70

A LA CARTE

Bacon (2)

(10 minimum)

$3



Turkey Bacon (2 pieces)

(10 minimum)

$3

Sausage Links (2)

(10 minimum)

$3

Sausage Patty (2)

(10 minimum)

$3

Turkey Sausage (2)

(10 minimum)

$3.45

Miniature Quiche (4)

(10 minimum / 4 per person) A variety of quiche including
Florentine, Ham & Cheese, Vegetable, and Bacon & Cheese.

$4.25

Grits

(10 minimum)

$3

Biscuits & Sausage Gravy (2)

(10 minimum)

$3.25

Scrambled Eggs (2)

(10 minimum)

$3.95

Pancakes (3)

(10 minimum) Served with butter, syrup and a seasonal fruit
garnish.

$6.55

Belgium Waffles

(10 minimum) Served with butter, syrup and a seasonal fruit
garnish.

$6.55

Challah French Toast (2)

(10 minimum) Served with butter, syrup, seasonal fruit garnish
and powdered sugar on the side.

$6.55



Hard Boiled Eggs (Dozen) $12

Breakfast Potatoes

(10 minimum)

$3

Hash Browns

(10 minimum)

$3

Biscuits (2 per person)

(10 MINIMUM) Sereved with butter and jelly.

$2.95

Extra Cream Cheese and Butter

(10 minimum)

$0.5

SNACKS

Fresh Whole Fruit

(10 minimum / 2 pieces per person)

$3.95

Seasonal Fresh Fruit Tray

(10 minimum) Pineapple, grapes, honeydew, cantaloupe, and
watermelon.

$4.25

Fruit Salad

(10 minimum) Apples, bananas, grapes, pineapple, honeydew,
cantaloupe, watermelon, and blueberries.

$4.45

Tropical Dried Fruit & Nut Bags

(10 minimum) Raisins, dried pineapple, dried mango, banana
chips, coconut flavored yogurt almonds, whole almonds, whole
cashews, orange flavored dried cranberries and coconut strips,
served in indi

$3.95

Ball Park Peanuts

(10 minimum) Old fashioned peanuts in a shell, served in
individual bags.

$2.25



Pub Mix

(10 minimum) A savory blend of crunchy snacks, served in
individual bags.

$3.95

Pistachios

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$3.35

Roasted Almonds

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$3.35

Southern Style Nuts

(10 minimum) A blend of cashews, peanuts, almonds, and
sesame sticks, served in individual bags.

$3.35

Sweet N Salty Mix $2.95

Pretzel Stix

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$2.25

Mini Pretzels

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$2.25

Peanut Butter Pretzels

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$2.95

Chex Mix

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$2.25

Hersheys Variety Pack $2.95

Mars Variety Pack

(10 minimum) Snickers, Snickers Almond, Twix, 3 Musketeers,
and Milky Way, served in individual bags.

$2

Starburst & Skittles Variety Pack

(10 minimum) Served in individual bags.

$2.55



Dessert Bars & Cookies

(10 minimum) Assorted brownies, lemon bars, pecan bars and
cookies.

$2.25

BEVERAGES

Freshly Brewed Coffee (Gallon)

Includes 10 cups, sweetener, creamer, and stirrers

$19.95

Orange Juice (Gallon)

Includes cups.

$13

Juice (Bottled) $1.95

All Day Beverage Service - Per Person

Requires Staffing - Includes hot tea, coffee, ice water, juices
and assorted sodas. Creamers, sweeteners, cups, ice, honey
and stir sticks replenished as needed.

$8.95

Hot Tea (Gallon)

Includes 10 cups, an assortment of tea bags, honey, and
spoons.

$19.95

Hot Chocolate (Gallon)

Includes 10 cups.

$19.95

Ice Tea (Gallon)

Includes 12 oz. cups, sweetener, lemons, and ice.

$13.25

Flavored Tea (Gallon)

Includes 12 oz. cups, sweetener, lemons, and ice.

$14.25

Yellow Lemonade (Gallon)

Includes 12 oz. cups and ice.

$13.25



Pink Lemonade (Gallon)

Includes 12 oz. cups and ice.

$13.25

Flavored Lemonade (Gallon)

Includes 12 oz. cups and ice.

$13

Coke (12 oz. can) $1.95

Diet Coke (12 oz. can) $1.95

Sprite (12 oz. can) $1.95

Dr. Pepper (12 oz. can) $1.95

Diet Dr. Pepper (12 oz. can) $1.95

Bottled Water $1.95

Ice Water Served in Acrylic Containers

(30 minimum) If no staff a pick up fee is required.

$0.75

EXTRAS

All Day Beverage Attendant $350

Table Cloth

Standard black banquet cloth for 6 feet and 8 feet tables

$15

Bar High Tables

30 Inch Round

$15

Table

60 Inch Round

$15

Service Fee



(Required for all Staffed Events) A service fee is added to all
staffed events. The service fees covers all necessary
equipment for your event.

$0

Event Captain

(Required for Staffed Events) Includes 4 hours of service.
Additional hours are billed at $37.50 per hour.

$175

Additional Captain Hours $37.5

China Rental

(Priced per person) Includes one dinner plate, one dessert, two
forks and one knife.

$5

China, glassware, silverware & linen napkins

Per guest

$5

ADD a China Coffee Cup, Saucer and Spoon

Per Person.

$1.25

Table Cloth

For a 6 table

$15

Table cloth - 60" Round

Table cloths go to the floor

$25

Additional Set Up - 1/2 Server $90

Additional Hour Staff

After 4 hour shift, servers are paid $30 per additional hour

$30

6 FT. TABLE

FOLDING TABLE USED FOR BUFFET OR REGISTRATION
TABLE AS REQUESTED

$15

Catering Service Agreement



TO CONFIRM AND FINALIZE YOUR EVENT: The catering
agreement must be signed to confirm the booking of your
event. Please print this order and initial each page and either
fax back to 713.758.0125 or

$0

Catering Service Agreement - Special Events

TO CONFIRM AND FINALIZE YOUR EVENT: The catering
agreement must be signed to confirm the booking of your
event. Please print this order and initial each page and either
fax back to 713.758.0125 or

$0


